RE: Computer

From: Tom Ronnkvist (tom@drillpipeinc.com)
To: kyle@northpointcomputers.com; admin@northpointcomputers.com

Date: Wednesday, April 23, 2025 at 09:09 AM CDT

Jose & Kyle,
| have waited patiently for a return of the funds for the computer | paid for and never received.

| have completed the forms and introduced evidence in this matter. There is a $254.00 filing fee that the
court said would be added to my judgement against you.

| thought | would give you one last attempt to reconcile this with us before | get the certified check for the
filing fee.

Please advise if you are going to refund the funds for this computer.

Thank you,



Tom Ronnkvist
President

(p) 763-592-8670
(f) 763-592-8661

Drill Pipe Inc.
602 Commerce St
Alice, TX 78332

Drill Pipe Inc.

550 3" Street South
Winsted, MN 55395

drillpipeinc.com
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This email, including attachments, may contain information that is privileged, confidential and/or proprietary. If you are NOT the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the information contained herein (including any reliance thereon) is
STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you received this email in error, please immediately contact the sender by replying to this message and delete the

email and any attachments in entirety, whether in electronic or hard copy format.

From: Tom Ronnkvist <tom@drillpipeinc.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 1, 2025 1:42 PM

To: Kyle Cantu <kyle@northpointcomputers.com>
Subject: Computer

Kyle,

i am wondering when you are sending me a plan to resolve this computer purchase
please advise

thanks

tom
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