
Fw: Computer tower

From: Kyle Cantu (kyle@northpointcomputers.com)

To: admin@northpointcomputers.com

Date: Wednesday, April 23, 2025 at 10:41 AM CDT

----- Forwarded Message -----
From: Kyle Cantu <kyle@northpointcomputers.com>
To: Tom Ronnkvist <tom@drillpipeinc.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2024 at 05:20:54 PM CDT
Subject: Re: Computer tower

Sounds good.

On May 16, 2024, at 5:11 PM, Tom Ronnkvist <tom@drillpipeinc.com> wrote:

Thanks, I’ll bring the computer when I come tomorrow 

Thanks Kyle

Tom Ronnkvist
President
Drill Pipe Inc
550 S 3rd Street
Winsted, MN 55395
PH: (763) 592-8670
FAX: (763) 592-8661
tom@drillpipeinc.com
www.drillpipeinc.com

On May 16, 2024, at 5:07 PM, Kyle Cantu <kyle@northpointcomputers.com> wrote:

Tom,

I found a machine that has all the expansion slots needed. After shipping and taxes would come out to
$689. Would you like me to send you an invoice for this or would you want to. come in to pay at the card
reader? This price would include the transfer of hard drive data and expansion cards needed to run your
welder.


